
PUBLIC NOTICE 
 

Hill County is currently soliciting bids to 
replace an approximately 100 ft long bridge 
over Brooken Creek in Hill County Precinct 
No. 3 on HCR 3206. Hill County will accept 
and/or reject bids based on the lowest and 
best bid. For specifications or a bid package 
please contact County Commissioner Scotty 
Hawkins at (254) 707-3051 or County Judge 
Justin W. Lewis at (254) 582-4020. Bidders 
should use unit pricing. Payment will be 
made by check or EFT and will be made 
thirty (30) days after receipt of invoice for 
goods or services received by the County out 
of budgeted funds.  
 Bids must be submitted to the Hill County 
Judges’ Office at the Hill County Courthouse, 
80 N. Waco St., 1st floor, Hillsboro, TX by 
2:00 p.m. on Thursday, February 4, 2021 with 
bids to be opened at 2:15 p.m. the same day 
in the Hill County Judges’ office. 
 The County reserves the right to accept or 
reject all bids. 
 
 
Publishing Notice: Must be published once a 
week with the first publishing to occur at least 
14 days before the date of bid opening. 


